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Accelerate Data Transfer with New-AzStorageMover PowerShell

In today's digital world, the need for efficient data transfer is paramount. Whether you are migrating
data to the cloud or transferring data across different storage accounts, the speed of the transfer can
greatly impact productivity. In the Windows environment, one powerful tool that can help accelerate
data transfer is the New-AzStorageMover PowerShell cmdlet.

The New-AzStorageMover cmdlet is part of the Azure PowerShell module and is specifically
designed to move data between Azure storage accounts. It leverages the power of parallel
processing to optimize the transfer speed, making it an ideal choice for large-scale data transfers.

One of the key advantages of using New-AzStorageMover is its ability to perform both online and
offline data transfers. Online data transfer allows you to move data while the storage account is still in
use, ensuring minimal downtime. Offline data transfer, on the other hand, is useful when you need to
perform a bulk transfer of data and can afford some downtime.

To use the New-AzStorageMover cmdlet, you need to have the Azure PowerShell module installed
on your Windows machine. Once installed, you can open a PowerShell window and run the
necessary commands to initiate the data transfer.

Here's an example of how you can use the New-AzStorageMover cmdlet to transfer data between
Azure storage accounts:

1. Open PowerShell and connect to your Azure account using the Connect-AzAccount cmdlet.
2. Run the New-AzStorageMover cmdlet with the required parameters, such as the source and

destination storage account names, the container name, and the number of parallel
operations.

3. Monitor the progress of the data transfer using the Get-AzStorageMoverStatus cmdlet.

By adjusting the number of parallel operations, you can fine-tune the transfer speed based on your
specific requirements. It's recommended to experiment with different values to find the optimal setting
for your data transfer.

In addition to the New-AzStorageMover cmdlet, there are alternative methods for accelerating data
transfer in the Windows environment. One popular option is to use AzCopy, a command-line tool that
provides similar functionality to New-AzStorageMover. AzCopy can be used to transfer data between
Azure storage accounts, on-premises storage, and even between different cloud providers.

Another alternative is to use the Azure Data Box family of products. These physical devices are
designed for offline data transfer and can significantly speed up the process, especially for large
amounts of data.

In conclusion, the New-AzStorageMover PowerShell cmdlet is a powerful tool for accelerating data
transfer in the Windows environment. By leveraging parallel processing and providing both online and
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offline transfer options, it offers a flexible and efficient solution for moving data between Azure
storage accounts. However, if the New-AzStorageMover cmdlet is not applicable to your specific
environment, alternatives such as AzCopy and Azure Data Box can provide viable options for
accelerating data transfer.
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